Appendix 2

Dr Hon Fernando CHEUNG’s first amending motion

Public Finance Ordinance
and

Rule 29(6) of the Rules of Procedure of the Legislative Council of
the Hong Kong Special Administrative Region

Amending Motion

Resolved that the motion to be moved by the Secretary for Financial Services
and the Treasury under section 7(1) of the Public Finance Ordinance (Cap. 2)
at the Legislative Council meeting of 18 March 2020 be amended as set out in

the Schedule.




Schedule

Amendments to Motion to be Moved by Secretary for
Financial Services and the Treasury
under Section 7(1) of Public Finance Ordinance

Paragraph 1 amended
Paragraph 1—

Delete
“$215,865,713,000”
Substitute
“$215,840,614,000”.

Schedule 1 amended

Schedule 1—

Add

“21 Chief Executive’s 000
Office

Operational expenses

0”.



Appendix 3

Dr Hon Fernando CHEUNG’s second amending motion

Public Finance Ordinance
and

Rule 29(6) of the Rules of Procedure of the Legislative Council of
the Hong Kong Special Administrative Region

Amending Motion

Resolved that the motion to be moved by the Secretary for Financial Services
and the Treasury under section 7(1) of the Public Finance Ordinance (Cap. 2)
at the Legislative Council meeting of 18 March 2020 be amended as set out in

the Schedule.




Schedule

Amendments to Motion to be Moved by Secretary for
Financial Services and the Treasury
under Section 7(1) of Public Finance Ordinance

Paragraph 1 amended
Paragraph 1—
Delete
“$215,865,713,000”
Substitute
“$210,280,401,000”,

Schedule 1 amended
Schedule 1—
Add
“122 Hong Kong 000  Operational expenses

Police Force 103 Rewards and special
services

207  Expenses of
witnesses, prisoners
and deportees

Schedule 2 amended
Schedule 2—
Add

“122 Hong Kong 603  Plant, vehicles and
Police Force equipment

614  Alterations, additions
and improvements to
in-service Marine
Police craft (block
vote)

661  Minor plant, vehicles
and equipment (block
vote)

695  Police specialised
vehicles (block vote)

0”.



Appendix 4

Hon WU Chi-wai’s amending motion

Public Finance Ordinance
and

Rule 29(6) of the Rules of Procedure of the Legislative Council of the
Hong Kong Special Administrative Region

Amending Motion

Resolved that the motion to be moved by the Secretary for Financial
Services and the Treasury under section 7(1) of the Public Finance
Ordinance (Cap. 2) at the Legislative Council meeting of 18 March 2020
be amended as set out in the Schedule.




Schedule

Amendments to Motion to be Moved by Secretary for
Financial Services and the Treasury
under Section 7(1) of Public Finance Ordinance

1. Paragraph 1 amended
Paragraph 1—

Delete
“$215,865,713,000”
Substitute
“$215,840,614,000”.

2. Paragraph 2A added
After paragraph 2—

Add

“2A.  This Resolution does not apply to Head 21 in the
Estimates of Expenditure 2020-21 laid before the
Legislative Council on 26 February 2020.”.



Appendix 5

Hon Andrew WAN’s amending motion

Public Finance Ordinance
and

Rule 29(6) of the Rules of Procedure of the Legislative Council of the
Hong Kong Special Administrative Region

Amending Motion

Resolved that the motion to be moved by the Secretary for Financial
Services and the Treasury under section 7(1) of the Public Finance
Ordinance (Cap. 2) at the Legislative Council meeting of 18 March 2020
be amended as set out in the Schedule.




Schedule

Amendments to Motion to be Moved by Secretary for
Financial Services and the Treasury
under Section 7(1) of Public Finance Ordinance

1. Paragraph 1 amended
Paragraph 1—

Delete
“$215,865,713,000”
Substitute
“$210,280,401,000”.

2. Paragraph 2A added
After paragraph 2—

Add

“2A.  This Resolution does not apply to Head 122 in the
Estimates of Expenditure 2020-21 laid before the
Legislative Council on 26 February 2020.”.



