
Appendix 1 







Appendix 2 









Product Eco-responsibility Ordinance 

and 

Interpretation and General Clauses Ordinance 

____________________ 

Resolution 

(Under section 29 of the Product Eco-responsibility Ordinance (Cap. 603) 
and section 35 of the Interpretation and General Clauses  

Ordinance (Cap. 1)) 
____________________ 

Product Eco-responsibility (Plastic Shopping Bags) 
(Amendment) Regulation 2022 

Resolved that the Product Eco-responsibility (Plastic Shopping Bags) 
(Amendment) Regulation 2022, made by the Secretary for the Environment under 
section 29 of the Product Eco-responsibility Ordinance (Cap. 603) on 7 June 2022 
be approved, subject to the amendments as set out in the Schedule. 

____________________ 

Appendix 3 



 

Schedule 
 

Amendments to Product Eco-responsibility (Plastic Shopping Bags) 
(Amendment) Regulation 2022 

 
1. Section 3 amended (Schedule amended (forms)) 

(1) Section 3(1)— 
Delete 
“$1” 
Substitute 
“$2”. 

(2) Section 3(2)— 
Delete 
“$1” 
Substitute 
“$2”. 

(3) Section 3(11)— 
Delete 
“$1” 
Substitute 
“$2”. 

(4) Section 3(12)— 
Delete 
“$1” 
Substitute 
“$2”. 

 



Interpretation and General Clauses Ordinance 

________________ 

Resolution 

(Under section 34(2) of the Interpretation and General Clauses Ordinance (Cap. 1)) 

________________ 

Product Eco-responsibility Ordinance (Amendment of Schedule 3) 
Order 2022 

Resolved that the Product Eco-responsibility Ordinance (Amendment of Schedule 3) 
Order 2022, published in the Gazette as Legal Notice No. 137 of 2022 and laid on the 
table of the Legislative Council on 15 June 2022, be amended as set out in the Schedule. 

_______________ 

Appendix 4 



 

Schedule 
 

Amendment to Product Eco-responsibility Ordinance (Amendment 
of Schedule 3) Order 2022 

 
1. Section 3 amended (Schedule 3 amended (amount prescribed for section 18A(2))) 

Section 3— 
Repeal 
“$1” 
Substitute 
“$2”. 

 


	Appendix 1 (1)
	Appendix 2
	Appendix 3
	Appendix 4

