
(Translation) 

Hon TANG Fei’s motion on 
“Actively building Hong Kong into an international education hub by 

formulating a comprehensive strategic development blueprint 
for Hong Kong’s education” 

Wording of the Motion 

That General Secretary XI Jinping explicitly mentioned in May 2023 ‘the need 
to improve the strategy of educational opening up, put equal emphasis on 
introducing overseas educational resources and going global, and put to good use 
world-class educational resources and innovative factors, so as to make China an 
influential and important education hub in the world.  It is important to 
participate in global education governance, vigorously promote the brand of 
“Study in China” ’; as education in the HKSAR is an integral part of the national 
education system, it is only natural for the SAR Government to play a more 
proactive role in the process of promoting the building of China’s education 
brand; the Chief Executive has also explicitly mentioned in the 2023 Policy 
Address the need to build Hong Kong into an international hub for post-secondary 
education; in this connection, this Council urges the SAR Government to adopt 
more proactive measures to formulate a comprehensive strategic development 
blueprint for Hong Kong’s education and provide more diversified education 
services and support measures, thereby playing the role of leveraging the SAR’s 
advantages for meeting the country’s needs in the field of education, maintaining 
and strengthening Hong Kong’s edge as an international city, and enabling the 
country’s and the SAR’s education to be more influential and have a greater say 
in the world. 
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